

## RESOLUTION 2022-07-11-07

**BE IT RESOLVED**, that the Shelby County Commission hereby awards the bid for Residential Garbage Collection and Recycling to the lowest responsive bidder, Waste Management. The effective date of the new bid will be October 1, 2022.

Residential Garbage Collection and Recycling Bid Results June 21, 2022					
Service	Republic Services	GFL	Waste Management	Amwaste	Amwaste (*Alternate Bid)
Garbage Residential I	NO BID	\$23.12	\$20.69	\$32.00	\$28.00
Garbage Residential II	NO BID	\$32.95	\$31.04	\$60.00	\$54.00
Garbage Residential III	NO BID	\$40.00	\$30.69	\$54.00	\$50.00
Yard Waste	NO BID	\$20.00	\$137.51	\$19.00	\$19.00
Bid Alternate A – Curbside Recycling	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID - * See Alt-Bid	NO BID
Bid Alternate B – Community Recycling Bins	NO BID	\$900.00	\$500.00	\$605.00	\$605.00

**RESOLVED**, the County Manager is hereby directed to execute the associated contract and proceed with any actions associated with this matter.

Said Ebid # 2022-6-11274 is located within the County Manager's Office.